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Judicial Committee
Resolution #10-150

RESOLUTION OF THE COUNTY BOARD
WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

AWARDING BID FOR BODY ARMOR
FOR THE SHERIFF’'S DEPARTMENT

WHEREAS, it is the intent of the Will County’s Sheriff's Department to be equipped and
ready for dangerous situations, and

WHEREAS, in order to obtain the most competitive rates for body armor, proposals were
solicited, and

WHEREAS, on March 24, 2010, the County Executive's Office opened six (6) proposals for
the purchase of body armor, and

WHEREAS, the Sheriff's Department, after intense review, has recommended to go with
the lowest responsible bidder of Streicher’s, Butler, Wi, the only vendor who met all criteria and
requirements. This is an approximate annual amount of $53,000.00, for the purchase of +/- 100
vests per year at a cost of $530.00 each. This will be a three (3) year contract, with tentative dates
of June 1, 2010 through May 31, 2010, and

WHEREAS, the Judicial Committee has concurred with this recommendation, with
necessary funding available in the Sheriff's Budget.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Will County Board hereby awards the
contract to provide body armor for the Sheriff's Department to the lowest responsible bidder of
Streicher’s, Butler, WI, the only vendor who met all criteria and requirements. This is an
approximate annual amount of $53,000.00, for the purchase of +/- 100 vests per year at a cost of
$530.00 each. This will be a three (3) year contract, with tentative dates of June 1, 2010 through
May 31, 2010.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Preamble of this Resolution is hereby adopted as if
fully set forth herein. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect upon its passage and
approval as provided by law.

Adopted by the Will County Board this 20" day of May, 2010.

Vote: Yes No Pass (SEAL)

Nancy Schultz Voots
Will County Clerk

Approved this day of , 2010.

Lawrence M. Walsh
Will County Executive

Res awarding bid body armor sheriff dept 20May10






Judicial Committee
Resolution #10-150
Attachment 1-Page 1 of 3

FROM THE DESK OF
RITA WEISS

PURCHASING DIRECTOR

BID HISTORY

ITEM: 2010-23A SHERIFF BODY ARMOR BID
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT
COUNTY EXECUTIVE PERMISSION TO BID: N/A BUDGETED ITEM

FINANCE COMMITTEE PERMISSION TO BID:  N/A BUDGETED ITEM

BID LETTING: FEBRUARY 24, 2010

PUBLISHED NOTICE: HERALD NEWS, JOLIET, FEBRUARY 2010
FUNDING SOURCE: 101-50-600-2420 & 101-50-606-2420

BID OPENING: MARCH 24, 2010, 11:10 A. M.

LOCATION: WILL COUNTY OFFICE BUILDING

302 N. CHICAGO ST.
JOLIET, IL. 60432

BIDDING RESULTS:

NUMBER RELEASED: 10 & INTERNET NUMBER RETURNED;: 6
BIDDER: TOTAL FOR ONE YEAR
STREICHER’S, BUTLER, WI $ 53,000.00

Gall's, Lexington, KY $ 48,500.00 -51,500.00
Ray O’Herron, Danville, IL $ 48,950.00 - 53,900.00
Police/Air One, South Elgin, IL $ 52,500.00

SRT Supply Inc, St. Petersburg, FL NO BID

JCM Uniforms, Joliet, IL NO BID

Attached is recommendation from Sgt. Mike Mackay, Sheriff's Training Unit, to award
bid to Streicher’s, Butler, WI, the only vendor who met all criteria and requirements.
This is an approximate annual amount of $53.000.00, for purchase of +/- 100 vests per
year at a cost of $530.00 each. This will be a three (3) year contract, with tentative
dates of June 1, 2010 through May 31, 2010.
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DEPARTMENT: BID #2010-23A SHERIFF BODY ARMOR
DUE: 3-24-10, 11:00 AM OPENED: 3-24-10,11:10 AM
BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIREMENTS TOTAL PRICE
SRTSupply Inc BID BOND YR 1
PRIME CERT YR 2 NO BID
St. Petersburg, FL ADDENDA REC'D YR 3
LEAD TIME ARO
SAMPLE SENT GRAND TOTAL
BID BOND YR 1
JCM Uniforms PRIME CERT YR 2 NO BID
ADDENDA REC'D YR 3
Joliet, IL LEAD TIME ARO
SAMPLE SENT GRAND TOTAL
BID BOND $15,750 ck YR 1 5625.00 52,500.00
Police/Air One PRIME CERT YES YR2 525.00 52,500.00
ADDENDA RECD YES-3 YR 3 525.00 52,500.00

South Elgin, IL

LEAD TIME ARO 30-45
SAMPLE SENT YES

GRAND TOTAL $ 157,500.00

Galls (Galls Point Blank)

Lexington, KY

BID BOND 10%

PRIME CERT YES
ADDENDA RECD YES -3
LEAD TIME ARO 3-5/30-45
SAMPLE SENT YES-3

YR1 515.00 51,500.00
YR2 515.00 51,500.00
YR3 515.00 51,500.00

GRAND TOTAL $ 154,500.00

Galls (PACA)

Lexington, KY

BID BOND 10%

PRIME CERT YES
ADDENDA REC'D YES -3
LEAD TIME ARO 3-5/30-45
SAMPLE SENT YES -3

YR 1 485.00 48,500.00
YR2 485.00 48,500.00
YR 3 485.00 48,500.00

GRAND TOTAL $ 145,500.00

Streicher’s

Butler, WI

BID BOND $15,900 ck
PRIME CERT YES
ADDENDA REC'D YES -3
LEAD TIME ARO 45
SAMPLE SENT YES

YR1 530.00
YR 2 530.00
YR 3 530.00

53,000.00
53,000.00
53,000.00

GRAND TOTAL $ 159,000.00

Ray O’Herron (Protective Prod)

BID BOND 10%
PRIME CERT YES
ADDENDA REC'D YES 2 of 3

YR 1 539.00 53,900.00
YR2 539.00 53,900.00
YR3 539.00 53,800.00

SAMPLE SENT YES

Danwville, IL LEAD TIME ARO 30
SAMPLE SENT YES GRAND TOTAL $ 161,700.00
BID BOND 10% YR1 489.50 48,950.00
Ray O’Herron (PACA) PRIME CERT YES YR2 489.50 48,950.00
ADDENDARECDYES20of3 | YR3 48950 48,950.00
Danwville, IL LEAD TIME ARO 21/21-28

GRAND TOTAL § 146,850.00

ALSO PRESENT:
Rita Weiss

Missy Miesmer
Sgt. Mike Mackay
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Will County Sheriff's Police Department

B TRAINING DIVISION

INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

To: Deputy Chief Romeo
From: Sergeant Michacl Mackay
Subject: Vest Bid Results

Date: April 20, 2010

Sir:

I received the vest bid documents and samples from Rita Weiss. Only one company met all of
the requirements for the vest bid Streicher’s with a bid of $530.00 per vest for the three year
period. My recommendation is Streicher’s.

Gall’s- Did not meet the sizing requirements of C1 sizing, that is the smallest vest. Current NIJ
standards do allow a vest to be cut down more than 1 inch on each side.

Ray O’Herrons did not meet the C1 sizing on the vest from PACA Point Blank. Their vest from
Protective Products did not include the ISO certification, insurance documentation or sizing all
requirements of the bid.

Police One Equipment did not meet the requirement of the 3 inch built up vertical spinal and
sternum trauma reduction zones.

If you have any questions ’please contact the Laraway Training Unit at 727-5296.
Thank you for your continued support.

CC:

Sheriff Kaupas
Under Sheriff Nowak
Rita Weiss

File






